
BID SIGNED
INSURANCE 

PROOF
BID BOND

Yes Yes Yes
$4.21 $6.10 $8.21 NO BID $13.39 $20.35 $25.41 $30.38 $45.56 NO BID $68.85
$4.21 $6.10 $8.21 NO BID $13.39 $20.35 $25.41 $30.38 $45.56 NO BID $68.85
$4.21 $6.10 $8.21 NO BID $13.39 $20.35 $25.41 $30.38 $45.56 NO BID $68.85

BID SIGNED
INSURANCE 

PROOF
BID BOND

Yes Yes Yes
$4.22 $6.11 $8.24 NO BID $13.44 $20.45 $25.55 $30.54 $45.80 NO BID $69.20
$4.22 $6.11 $8.24 NO BID $13.44 $20.45 $25.55 $30.54 $45.80 NO BID $69.20
$4.22 $6.11 $8.24 NO BID $13.44 $20.45 $25.55 $30.54 $45.80 NO BID $69.20

54” 60”

$10,000 Minimum

TABULATION SHEET
BID 2014-09 PLASTIC TILE

60”

DESCRIPTION

SIZE 12” 15” 18” 21” 24”

$3,000 Minimum
$5,000 Minimum

30” 36” 42” 48”

$3,000 Minimum
$5,000 Minimum

$10,000 Minimum

HD SUPPLY

24”

December 16, 2014

VENDOR INFORMATION
FERGUSON WATERWORKS

SIZE 12” 15” 18” 21” 30” 36” 42” 48” 54”
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